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History More importantly though, the information that we’ve found on third-party customer survey resources
presents the website in a positive light – at least so do roughly estimated 80% of PlanetDrugsDirect reviews,
with further 15% being moderately satisfied opinions. There is a highly useful feature of refills management.

License

License There is no licensing number available for public viewing, but the drugstore is accredited for selling
pharmaceutical products, according to unbiased PlanetDrugsDirect reviews. The e-store has been around for
some 17 years now – in the world of come-an-go sprinter pharmacies, this is a record which can only be
explained by the legitimate status and honest work of the website. The site is listed and approved by
PharmacyChecker with their certificate displayed on the front page. The site requires a prescription for
legend drugs, which is a sure sign of a trustworthy licensed pharmacy.

Drugs

Drugs There is an extremely elaborate choice of health categories to order drugs by; there are more than a
100 of them (Asthma, Allergies, Antibacterials, Antivirals, Men’s Health, Stomach Health, Heart &
Cholesterol Drug, Women’s Health, to name a few). The bestsellers displayed on the front page, as far as we
could gather, are also the strongest focus of the pharmacy, are Viagra, Cialis, Levitra, but also Domperidome,
Effexor and the like. What is PlanetDrugsDirect.com and what does it offer? PlanetDrugsDirect.com is an
online pharmacy that offers a wide range of prescription and over-the-counter medications. They specialize
in providing affordable drug options, including both generic and brand-name medications, to customers
worldwide. Is PlanetDrugsDirect.com a reliable and safe platform for purchasing medications? The reliability
and safety of PlanetDrugsDirect.com for purchasing medications are important for customers to consider. It’s
recommended to check the pharmacy’s credentials, ensure regulatory compliance, and review customer
feedback before making any transactions. What types of medications are available through
PlanetDrugsDirect.com? PlanetDrugsDirect.com provides a variety of medications for various health
conditions, including chronic diseases, lifestyle medications, and other treatment options. They likely offer
both generic and brand-name drugs to meet the needs of their customers. What are the shipping and payment
policies of PlanetDrugsDirect.com? Details about the shipping and payment policies of
PlanetDrugsDirect.com might not be clearly stated on their site. Customers should contact the pharmacy
directly for information on shipping fees, delivery times, accepted payment methods, and any return policies.

Price list

Price list The prices at the store, according to what we have seen and what is pointed out by many customers,
are anything but low. They can be described as moderate, with a few occasional good finds and great deals,
but this is surely not a dime store. Drug Name Price silagra 100 From $0.15 suhagra 100 From $0.1 nizagara
100 mg From $0.2 kamagra 100mg From $0.4 tadacip 20mg From $0.66 On the upside, you know what you
are paying for: the approved and legitimate trade of high quality and very well assorted drugs. If you are



lucky to get a hold of PlanetDrugsDirect coupon, you will save up to 10% – as mentioned by customer
reviews.

Customer support

Customer support Customer Support services extend to ordering by phone or by email, with the reps ready to
take out your shopping list and do it all for you during the opening hours. You can even use fax machine for
sending in your shopping list and prescriptions. However, they might be somewhat slow responding to
emails, according to what we have read on third-party pharmacy survey sites.

Discounts

Discounts The site appears to be somewhat stingy with the deals and mark-downs. We haven’t found any
PlanetDrugsDirect discount offers on the site directly, which is somewhat disappointing for a website with
such relatively costly drugs. However, there is a 100% money-back guarantee which is a very rare feature for
a pharmacy, because of limitations imposed for the personal hygiene and pharmacy products. Since they will
have to dispose of returned goods, it is only natural that they hedge their interests by not distributing
PlanetDrugsDirect coupon code left and right.

Conclusion

Conclusion Despite the fact that it is fairly impossible to get a PlanetDrugsDirect.com discount and the prices
are on the higher end of average, the pharmacy is popular for a reason, which is great level of credibility and
customer protection policies. By the time this PlanetDrugsDirect review was written, the website’s quality of
service had never been questioned by either users or authorities.
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